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Abstract 
The purpose of the study was to identify the impact of emotional intelligence on vocational interests among 
Palestinian students. A sample of 333 students in the southern Hebron district participated in the study. Data was 
analysed using SPSS. The results showed that Palestinian students had a high level of emotional intelligence and 
a moderate level of vocational interests. Emotional intelligence appeared as an innovative prediction of 
vocational interests. The consequences of the findings for practice are highlighted. 
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1. Introduction 
Emotional intelligence has attracted great interest from scientists around the world in light of its importance and 
impact on personality, performance, strength, and student development (Gardner, 1983; Mayer & Salovey, 1990; 
Goleman, 1995, 2009; Vincent, 2003; Khawaldeh, 2004; Abu Rayyash et al., 2006; Joshi et al., 2012). 

Numerous published studies have dealt with emotional intelligence and its various models due to the great 
developments observed in this era and the subsequent goals, as we are in an era where we are competing with 
time, space, high aspirations and cultural variations. 

Vocational tendency is one of the most important factors that aids an individual to decide his/her field of study. If 
an individual scientifically deliberates the decision on the basis of vocational interests, it would enable one to 
succeed in life and be innovative in the field of choice. Each individual has job preferences based on his/her 
personal interests and desires (Tortillas, 1999; Aldahri, 2005). 

People tend to prefer a vocation that helps them attain their goals such as living a good life, nutrition, housing, 
security, a good position in the community and so on. It is during adolescence that a call is for some people the 
most important step in life, while for others, it is a fairly important step that can be changed and made more 
flexible at all times. Choosing a vocation also leads to one selecting a lifestyle (Deniz et al., 2014). 

Vocational interest is a fundamental factor, which serves as a guide and directs individuals to select their fields of 
specialty, which eventually culminates in success and develops their creativity (Turner & Lapan, 2005). 

2. Background and Literature Review 
2.1 Emotional Intelligence  

Emotional intelligence was rooted in social intelligence and was introduced for the first time by Thorndike in 
1920 to refer to the ability to understand and handle people and to act wisely in human relations (Hafiz, 2011; 
Ghaonta & Kumar, 2014). However, Gardner's writings (1983) on human intelligence and his theory of multiple 
intelligences have paved the way for the widespread define of emotional intelligence.  

Gardner (1983) introduced the idea of multiple intelligences, which included both interpersonal intelligence and 
intrapersonal intelligence. However, Mayer and Salovey, the first to provide a definition of the term emotional 
intelligence as ‘a form of social intelligence that involves the ability to monitor their own and others' feelings, to 
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distinguish between them and use the information to guide one's thoughts and actions’ (1993, p. 433). 
Additionally, they suggested a model with four-branches of emotional intelligence, which considers emotions as 
useful sources that help one make sense of and navigate the social environment, that are perceiving emotions, 
using emotions, understanding emotions, and managing emotions. 

Furthermore, Goleman expanded the model to four branches after incorporating Mayer and Salovey’s (1990) five 
essential elements of emotional intelligence, that are emotional self-knowledge, self-regulation, motivation, 
empathy, and social skills. 

2.2 Vocational Interests  

Vocational interests are personality indicators in work, studies, hobbies, leisure activities and choices (Holland, 
1985). A person responds to particular vocational interests, general subjects and activities with responses such as 
‘I like it’, ‘I don't like it’ or ‘It doesn't matter’ (Savickas, 1999). Despite the various views, there are many 
common problems regarding the definition of vocational interest. Based on the above, vocational can be defined 
as an actual process in which a person voluntarily attaches importance to an object without a particular effort, 
carries out that attention for an extended period of time and is aware of it and converts it into an answer and 
attitude. 

Vocational interests can be classified as expressed and measured. The expressed interests are generally 
determined by answers derived from open questions. Measured interests arise when people discover their 
professional choices better than a professional interest list. Although there are several methods used to measure 
their professional interests, the most widely used method is a list of interests. The statement of interests is widely 
used for a person to express their interest by registering and comparing different vocations (Deniz, 2013). 

Several studies have revealed that comprehending vocational interests helps to guide the individual in 
determining the decisions that must be owned in every stage of vocational growth. An understanding of the 
evolution of vocational interests helps counsellors to intervene in a timely and effective manner in order to 
modify any defect in vocational growth (Namourah, 2016). 

Emotional intelligence and vocational interest are topics of popular discussion in humanities. In a recent study, 
Kurdish and Korkmaz (2018) indicated that emotional intelligence was considered as observed variable, and 
emotional instability was a positive prediction for career decision difficulties. 

Di Fabio’s study (2017) concluded that emotional intelligence is an innovative variable in career decision 
making. In the same context, Kemboi et al. (2016) stated that there was a correlation between personality types 
and professional choice. 

The results in Huhtala’s (2016) study have supported the idea that training courses for the development of 
emotional intelligence can be resources that can be used by career counsellors when advising people who are 
exploring their career path. Liu et al. (2014) revealed that professional maturity was positively correlated with 
the achievement of work, and both emotional intelligence and social professional interest reinforced the positive 
relationship between professional maturity and work performance. 

Furthermore, the relationship between character strength and vocational interests has been tested by Proyer et al. 
(2012). The results showed that intellectual forces have created primary relationships with investigative and 
artistic interests, and social interests correlated with forces of transcendence and forces directed at others and 
career interests with forces. 

Finally, Dahl and Cilliers (2012) concluded that neither cognitive ability nor any aspect of emotional intelligence 
predicted a change in negative career thinking. However, Puffer's study (2011) revealed that emotional 
intelligence is a prominent prediction for professional personality. 

To sum up, the choice of careers is a national problem. Previous studies reported that post-secondary education 
statistics revealed that 20% to 60% of the freshmen class were undecided or uncertain of their career choice 
(Goleman, 2009, p. 18; Ghaonta & Kumar, 2014; Namourah, 2016).  

3. Purpose and Scope 
The study addressed the impact of emotional intelligence on vocational interests among Palestinian students. 
Emotional intelligence is one of the most important aspects of the personality, which plays an active role in 
guiding and directing people to choose their specialties, leading to success and developing their creativity. The 
study is considered a pioneer to the authors' knowledge, and has shown that emotional intelligence and 
vocational interests, through empirical study, were relatively limited in the occupied Palestinian community, 
where the unemployment rate among undergraduates is considered a risk factor. 
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4. Hypothesis 
Based on the revised literature, the study proposed the following hypothesis: 

Is there any impact of emotional intelligence on vocational interests among Palestinian students? 

5. Methods  
5.1 Approach  

The study adopted the quantitative research method. The questionnaire is suitable for the exploratory nature of 
the research. 

5.2 Population and Sampling 

The target population consisted of high school students in southern Hebron district during the 2018/2019 
academic year, which included 2485 students – 968 males for 1517 females (Palestinian Ministry of Education, 
2018). 

The total sample included 333 students (130 men and 203 women) in the southern Hebron district. The sample 
was chosen based on gender and stream. Sample size was calculated using an online tool: 
http://www.surveysystem.com/sscalc.htm, sample size calculator, with a margin error of 0.05. 

5.3 Instrumentation 

Emotional intelligence was assessed using a 33-point scale index introduced by Schutte et al. (1998), while 
vocational interests were assessed using a 42-point scale index introduced by the Netherlands (1997) and taking 
into account the cultural appropriateness of the Palestinian community. A 5-point Likert scale was used to 
measure the responses (always, often, neither, rarely, never). Participants in selected high schools in the southern 
Hebron district were asked to complete the questionnaire. The sample survey tool searched for basic information 
about the participants in gender, stream, family birth rank, and grade point average (GPA). 

5.3.1 Instrument Validity 

The instrument validation was measured in two different phases. The initial phase involved a group of experts 
who provided feedback on the tool. The second phase involved the implementation of a pilot study (N=50) to 
validate the study tool using exploratory factorial analysis. Factor loading for all items exceeded 0.75 (from 0.78 
to 0.89), which implied that these elements were capable of measuring any element of emotional intelligence and 
vocational interest among the sampled population. 

5.3.2 Instrument Reliability 

Reliability was tested using Cronbach's Alpha coefficient to determine the reliability and consistency of the study 
findings. Cronbach's Alpha for emotional intelligence and vocational interest were (0.90; 0.92) respectively, 
demonstrating excellent reliability and consistency. 

The participants' demographic distribution was as follows: gender, stream, family birth rank and GPA. Overall, 
the sample contained 333 students. Participants' GPA was between 65 and 95 points (M 76.70 SD 10.72). The 
females represented 61.0% of the participants, while the remaining 39% were males. The sample was drawn by 
artistic and scientific streams. The arts accounted for 67.3% of the sample, while 32.7% were the natural 
sciences, and half (57.9%) of the participants were of middle family birth rank. 

5.4 Data Analysis  

The questionnaire items were evaluated on a 1-5 Likert scale (never to always), the highest score indicated a 
high level of emotional intelligence and vocational interests. Descriptive statistics measured emotional 
intelligence and vocational interests among the sampled population using Pearson correlation, Cronbach's Alpha 
and Factor Analysis through SPSS. 

6. Findings 
The results revealed that participants experienced a high level of emotional intelligence and a moderate level of 
vocational interests. The mean scores and standard deviation were (M 3.72, SD 0.34; M 3.44, SD 0.74) 
respectively.  

In addition, the results showed a statistically significant positive correlation between emotional intelligence and 
vocational interests among Palestinian students, where the R-correlation was (0.574, P=0.000). It was discovered 
that as emotional intelligence increases, vocational interests grow and vice versa. 
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7. Discussion and Recommendations 
The findings of the study revealed the effect of emotional intelligence in innovative vocational interests among 
Palestinian students. This result is considered a very important element in the Palestinian society, taking into 
consideration the difficulties the Palestinian educational system faces in terms of the high unemployment rate 
among graduated students that exceeded 45% among science graduates and 65% among arts graduates under the 
on-going Israeli occupation, which created negative trends among the students toward vocational interests 
(Namourah, 2016). However, Emotional intelligence is considered an important dimension in the correspondence 
between success, in general, and, in particular, vocational interests. Emotionally intelligent students have the 
ability to feel comfortable with themselves and others; they have the ability to understand, perceive and monitor 
their feelings (Banat & Rimawi, 2014). This would lead them to possessing a sense of stability and calm and 
psychological ease that would positively affect their spirits and motivate them to increase their vocational 
interests. The results have different implications with regard to emotional intelligence as a prediction of 
vocational interests for parents, teachers, social advisors, and decision makers.  

Furthermore, being emotionally intelligent is an important stage in the formation and development of one's 
personality; it represents a turning point in the lives of students who aim to fulfil their desires, abilities, 
preferences and interests. Emotional intelligence also encounters the social interaction that contributes to the 
development of students' personalities; it enhances their learning skills and thinking; and helps in decision 
making (Banat & Rimawi, 2014) and vocational interests. 

Moreover, when emotional intelligence has proven to be an important indicator of vocational interests, this 
reflects how the affective domain, the environment, creativity, self-perception, career desires and interpersonal 
skills help to make well-informed choices beyond the cognitive domain of being emotionally intelligent. Based 
on the results of this study, the following recommendations were formulated: 

1. Update the Palestinian educational system with emotional intelligence as an innovative component of 
vocational interests. 

2. Encourage the exchange of knowledge on emotional intelligence among students in general and students 
seeking professional guidance, in particular using modern techniques. 

3. Further studies are recommended to establish a clearer understanding of emotional intelligence and 
vocational interests among Palestinian students. 
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